



Bid Tabulation

PROJECT TITLE
DATE / TIME:

2023 Rylko Parks Improvement Project
December 20, 2022, 10am

BIDDER	ATTEND PRE-BID	ADD #01	BID FORMS										CERTIFICATIONS							REFERENCES	REMARKS	
			BASE BID	ALTERNATE #A	ALTERNATE #B	ALTERNATE #C	ALTERNATE #D	BID BOND	WARRANTY	UNIT COST WORKSHEET	AGREEMENT	SUBST. DATE	Anti-Collusion Affidavit	Harassment Policy Form	Drug Free Work Place	Bid Rigging Form	Equal Employment	Law Compliance	INSURANCE			
Bear Construction	N/A	Y	\$543,930.60	\$125,009.02	\$52,255.36	\$29,099.16	\$24,947.35	Y	12	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	N	
Bee Liner Lean Services	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Chicagoland Paving Contractors Inc.	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Construction Inc.	N/A	Y	\$608,000.00	\$122,000.00	\$77,000.00	\$44,000.00	\$40,000.00	Y	12	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
D&J Landscape Inc.	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Dodge Data & Analytics	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Energia LLC Sewer Rehab Contractors	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Hacienda Landscaping Inc	N/A	Y	\$418,278.00	\$76,369.00	\$59,900.00	\$17,000.00	\$29,780.00	Y	12	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
Innovation Landscape Inc.	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
M & J Asphalt Paving Company	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Manusos General Contracting Inc.	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Schafeges Brothers Inc.	N/A	Y	\$629,777.00	\$99,300.00	\$69,000.00	\$27,300.00	\$24,400.00	Y	12	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
SD Industries	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			
Tandem Construction Inc.	N/A	N/A	NO BID SUBMITTED																			